City Council Agenda: 2/9/2026

2M. Consideration of authorizing the purchase of a 2027 Volvo VHD Tandem Axle Cab and
Chassis from Nuss Truck & Equipment equipped with Force America controls, a dump
body and Falls plow equipment from Towmaster and purchase of associated auto

greaser from Lubecore MN for a net cost of $345,499.22 and to declare the current

Truck 116 as surplus

Prepared by: Meeting Date: Consent Agenda Item

Street S intendent 02/09/2026
reet superintenden 109/ [] Regular Agenda Item

Reviewed by: Approved by:

PW Director/City Engineer, Finance City Administrator

Director

ACTION REQUESTED

Motion to authorize purchase of a 2027 Volvo VHD tandem axel cab and chassis from Nuss
Truck & Equipment equipped with Force America controls, a dump body and Falls plow
equipment from Towmaster and purchase of associated auto greaser from Lubecore MN for a
net cost of $345,499.22 and to declare the current Truck 116 as surplus.

REFERENCE AND BACKGROUND

The 2026 budget includes $400,000 for the purchase of a new plow truck. Staff request
authorization to purchase a 2027 Volvo VHD tandem axle cab and chassis from Nuss Truck and
Equipment of Mankato, MN outfitted with additional equipment as listed below. The final cost
includes the trade-in value for the existing plow truck being replaced.

Company Equipment Cost
Nuss Truck & Equipment Volvo Cab & Chassis $170,807.22
Towmaster Dump Body, Snowplow Equipment, Force America $212,342
Controls

Lubecore MN Automatic Lubrication System $10,350
$393,499.22

Nuss Truck & Equipment Trade-In Value for 2012 Mack (548,000)
$345,499.22
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The new truck will replace the City’s 2012 Mack Granite hook/plow truck. Although the City
operated a 2008 Sterling plow truck that is older, staff recommend replacing the 2012 Mack
truck first due to ongoing reliability issues and downtown. The 2012 truck has had ongoing
mechanical and electrical issues, including failures related to its first-generation diesel exhaust
system and more recent computer and wiring failures. Replacement parts are difficult to
obtain, resulting in increased downtime and repair costs. Over $50,000 in repairs beyond
normal maintenance have been required, including $14,983.98 for recent computer and wiring
harness repairs.

Two cab and chassis were evaluated through the state contract: Mack and Volvo. The Volvo was
$122.32 more expensive than the Mack; however, the City currently owns two Volvo trucks
with positive performance history, and operators prefer the Volvo cab configuration. Based on
these factors, staff recommend purchasing the Volvo.

There are two companies in Minnesota that outfit plow equipment. Due to past performance
experience, staff recommend outfitting the truck with Towmaster equipment. Towmaster has
outfitted all but one of the plows and has the strongest results. Installation of the plow
equipment is anticipated in 2027.

Finally, staff recommend utilizing the Lubecore auto-greaser to maintain fleet consistency and
prevent having to stock different styles of grease cartridges.

. Budget Impact: The 2026 Central Equipment Fund budget includes $400,000 for the
replacement of one plow truck. The Towmaster plow equipment will not be installed
until 2027, therefore the 2027 Central Equipment Fund budget will reflect that cost.

1. Staff Workload Impact: Improve efficiency with time, vehicle failure and safety.
1. Comprehensive Plan Impact: N/A

STAFF RECOMMENDED ACTION

Staff recommend purchase of the 2027 Volvo and associated equipment as noted and declaring
the Truck 116 2012 Mack as surplus.

SUPPORTING DATA

e Quotes
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2M (1)
Print Date & Time 10/17/2025 8:20
TANDEM AXLE CAB/CHASSIS
Exhibit D: Price Schedule
VENDOR NAME Nuss Truck and Equipment
MAKE AND MODEL 2025 Volvo VHD 64F300 TA
wB
ca | Grand Total $ 170,807.22
AF
Rear Ratio
Cab Color
Wheel
Color
Notes NUSS20250000185092D - City Of Monticello
Code : Spect | Description iQty: 2025Price :  Subtotal |
VHD64F300 1.0 Price for Base Unit: _1  $125579.00 125,579.00
20 FRAME OPTIONS
X4XB1X 21 |Front frame extension 1/8$  14300($ 143.00
x2345 22 |Custom hole punching in frame $ 110.00]$ -
984DX 23  [Deduct for no front bumper $ (60.00)| $ -
403003 24 |Frame fastener option (bolt or huck spun) 1 STD
25 |Frame, R.B.M., S.M,, PS|, CT $ -
ALY 26 |11.81"x3.54"x.31".,, R.B.M. 2,112,000, S.M. 17.6, PS|,120,000 CT 0 STD
RCo000 27 |11.81"x3.54"x.38"., R.B.M. 2,460,000, S.M. 20.5, PSI,120,000 CT $  343.00($ -
203010 28 |11.81"x3.54"x.44"., R.B.M. 2,820,000, S.M. 23.5, PSI,120,000 CT 0|$ 562.00]|$% -
403011 29 |11.81"x4.13"x.44"., R.B.M. 3,156,000, S.M. 26.3, PSI,120,000 CT 1]$ 720008 720.00
3.0 FRONT AXLE/SUSPENSION/BRAKE/OPTION
MC 31 |Set Forward Front Axle Option 1 STD
370403 32 [14,600 front axle and matching suspension 1 STD
370405 33 [16,500 front axle and matching suspension $  875.00($% -
370406 34 (18,800 front axle & matching suspension $ 978.00|$ B
370407 35 20,800 front axle and matching suspension 1]1$ 1,079.00| $ 1,079.00
270408 36 22,800 front axle and matching suspension Volvo F22 $ 1,154.00($ -
371071 37 |Heavy duty front axle shocks 018 50.00| $ 2
T 38 |Front Brake Dimension 16.5x6 118 67.00| $ 67.00
OKXG1X 39 |Hubs Front axle iron unitized front axle hubs 118 25.00( $ 25.00
NA 3.10 |Right hand air bag suspension per Spec 3.7, Driver controlled No Bid
NA 311  |Left air bag suspension per Spec 3.7, Driver controlled No Bid
ZGXE1X 312 |Front axle lubrication cap with slotted venthole No Bid
UDXA1X 313  [Front brake dust shields 1 STD
XEXB1X 314 |Dual front auxiliary steering gear 1($ 146400 % 1,464.00
0371074 315 |Multi Leaf Front Susp (RH Stiffner) $ 91.00( =
XEXA1X 316 [Right Hand Ram Assist $ 1,230.00| $ =
40 4.0 TANDEM REAR AXLE/SUSPENSION/BRAKE/OPTIONS
46,000# rear axle & matching suspension
350380 41 Meritor RT46-160 & Volvo 46k T-Ride 11% 1,93200($ 1,932.00
40,000# walking beam rear suspension and axle
350360 42 |Make & Model - Meritor MT-40-14X4D with Hendrickson HMX EX 400 $ 791.00 | $ -
46,000# walking beam rear suspension and axle
350350 43 |Make & Model - Meritor MT-46-160 with Hendrickson HMX EX 460 $ 2184.00($ -
40,000# air suspension and axle
350324 44  |Make & Model - Meritor MT-40-14X4D & HAS-400 $ 510.00 | s
46,000# air suspension and axle
350312 45 |Make & Model - Meritor RT-46-160 & HAS-460 $ 2276.00|$ N
350324-1 46 |Dash mounted air dump system $ 243.00( $ =
Driver activated differential lock on one rear axle (frontaxle __ rear
TUXD1X 47 |axle____, check one) $ 360.00 | $ -
TUXA1X 48 |Driver activated differential lock on both front and rear axles $ 703.00| $ -
Driver activated differential lock on both front and rear axles, and
MC 49 |lubrication pump and filter system 118 974.00( $ 974.00
Meritor RT-46-160P, both axles driver differential lock and pump,
MC 410 |HMX460 46,000 # walking beam suspension $ 2688.00|% -
NA 411 |Y2round universal joints 1 STD
THXC2X 412 |Spicer 1810 HD drive line with half round universal joints $ 230.00 | $ -
UEXA1X 413 |Rear brake dust shield 119 40.00 | § 40.00
350377 4.14 |40,000Ib Volvo T Ride Suspension (2 leaf firm ride) 54" spacing 0 STD
35078 4.15 [40,000Ib Volvo T Ride Suspension (3 leaf firm ride) 54" spacing $ 138.00| $ -
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784013 416 |Meritor Brake Adjuster Front and Rear $ 11.00| $ 11.00
UKXB1X 417 |Extended length brake stoke $ 54.00| $ “
781104 418 |Fur Cam type haldex life seal plus $ 107.00| $ -
TWXB1X 419 |Synthetic Rear Axle Lubricant $ 117.00| $ 117.00
IR 420 [Rear Shock Absorbers $  350.00|% 350.00
R4XA1X 421 |Rear Axle Lube Pump $ 320.00| $ =
330684 422 |Meritor MT-40-14X4D Hypoid Rear Axle 40,000Ib capacity STD
s0 FIFTH WHEEL OPTIONS
X6XA2X 51 |Frame end tapered and open $ 12.00($ -
X6XB2X 52 |Frame end tapered and closed $ 30.00 | $ =
330AB7 53 |Fixed fifth wheel - Holland FW-35 $ 684.00 | $ =
330AE7 54 [Mechanical slide fifth wheel - Holland FW35, Travel - 24" slide $ 562.00 | $ =
330AH4 55 |Air slide fifth wheel - Holland FW35, Travel - 24" slide $ 986.00 | $ -
464AA5 56 |Stainless 1/4 fenders, mounted front of tandems $ 127.00 | $ -
464AA2 57 |Plastic 1/4 fenders, mounted front of tandems $ 110.00 | § -
WHX01X 58 |Tractor package hookup $ 297.00 | $ -
TKXA3X 59 |Behind cab deck plate $ 681.00 | $ 2
330AB8 510 |Holland fixed with non-tilt 5th wheel $ 1,385.00 | $ -
330AEF 511  [Holland manual slide 5th wheel $ 537.00 [ $ &
69XD3X 512 [Mud flaps with brackets $ 115.00 | $ =
69XC3X 513 |Betts B60 stainless steel angled mud flap brackets $ 161.00 | § -
51XD1X 514 |Hose tender & towel bar assembly $ 58.00 | $ -
5ZXB1X 5.15 |Coiled trailer air hose $ 39.00 | § =
2UAB1X 5.16 |Coiled trailer electrical hose $ 44.00 | $ -
OBS04S 5.17 | Air Weight AW5800 onboard scales $ 111800 |9 =
6HXBRX 518 [Medium height 5th wheel ramp guide $ 22800(% Z
322022 519  [Trailer hook up light $ 74.00 | $ :
60 TIRES/RIMS OPTIONS:
NA 6.1 Nylon wafers or wheel guards on all wheels (10 ea) $ 4400| $ 44.00
Heavier 7500 Ib 22.5 x 8.25 Steel rims in lieu of standard 7300# rims
NA 62 |(10ea) STD
084441 6.3 |22.5 12.5 Black Powder quoted wheels front and back $ 482.00 | $ -
Heavier 7500 Ib 22.5 x 8.25 Steel rims in lieu of standard 7300# rims (8
NA 6.4 |ea)in rear only $ (16.00)| $ -
Front Tire Package i
11R22.5H GOODYEAR G731 MSA (13220 LBS. GAWR) MULTI
093760 65 |USAGE $ 288.00( $ -
[TTR22.5H GOODYEAR G751 MSA (13220 LBS. GAWR) MULTI
093762 66 |USAGE $ 258.00 | $ -
71R24.5H BRIDGES TONE M863 (14320 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD
093299 6.7 |USAGE $ 2,240.00| $ =
11R24.5H BRIDGESTONE R250ED (14320 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL /
093562 6.8 |URBAN USAGE $ (85.00)| $ -
11R24.5H BRIDGESTONE R268 (14320 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL /
093741 69 |URBAN USAGE (75.00)| $ -
T1R24.5H BRIDGES TONE R283A ECOPIA (14320 LBS. GAWR)
093796 6.10 |LONG /REGIONAL HAUL $ (85.00)| $ -
11R24.5H GOODYEAR G731 MSA (14320 LBS. GAWR) MULTI
093761 611 |USAGE $ 380.00| $ -
T1R24.5H GOODYEAR G751 MSA (14320 LBS. GAWR) MULTI
093763 6.12 |USAGE $ 335.00| $ -
[T1R24.56H MICHELIN XZE2 (14320 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL / URBAN
093591 6.13 |USAGE $ 1648.00|$ =
11R24.5H MICHELIN X WORKS Z (14320 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF
093804 6.14 |ROAD USAGE $ 100.00| $ =
12R22.5H GOODYEAR G751 MSA (14780 LBS. GAWR) MULTI
093764 6.15 |USAGE $ 468.00( $ -
12R24.5H MICHELIN X WORKS Z (15660 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF
093805 6.16 |ROAD USAGE $ 210.00( $ -
275/80R22.5H MICHELIN X LINE ENERGY Z (14320 LBS. GAWR)
093790 6.17 |LONG / REGIONAL HAUL $ (40.00)| $ -
093758 315/80R22.5L GOODYEAR G751 MSA (18180 LBS. GAWR) MULTI
6.18 |USAGE $ 675.00 | $ -
093828 315/80R22.5L MICHELIN X LINE ENERGY Z (18180 LBS. GAWR)
6.19 |LONG HAUL $ 95.00| $ -
093806 [315/80R22.5L MICHELIN X WORKS Z (18180 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF
620 |ROAD USAGE $ 235.00( $ -
093672 1315/80R22.5L MICHELIN XZUS2 (20000 LBS. GAWR) URBAN
621 |USAGE $ 245.00| $ 245.00
093823 [315/80R22.5L CONTINENTAL CITY SERVICE HA3 (20000 LBS.
6.22 |GAWR) URBAN USAGE $ 450.00 | $ -
093747 [385/65R22.5J BRIDGESTONE M854 (18740 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF
623 |ROAD USAGE $ 200.00| $ -
093495 [385/66R22.5J MICHELIN XZY3 (18740 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD
6.24 |USAGE $ 265.00 | $ -
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093567 [385/65R22.51 MICHELIN XFE (19840 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

625 |USAGE $ 335.00( $ -

Rear Tire Package ]

094673 11R22.5G BRIDGESTONE M770 (23360 LBS. GAWR) LONG7/

6.26 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 225.00( $ -
094810 [11R22:5G BRIDGESTONE M726 EL A (21660 LBS. GAWR) LONG 7

6.27 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 135.00| $ -
094297 11R22.5G BRIDGESTONE M843 (23360 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

628 |USAGE $ 690.00 | $ S
094736 [11R225G BRIDGES TONE R268 (23360 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL

629 [HAUL STD
094821

6.30  [11R22.5G CONTINENTAL HDL2 (22700 LBS. GAWR) LONG HAUL $ 595.00( $ -
094701 meWAWR) LONG/

6.31  |REGIONAL HAUL $ 1,085.00($ -
094350 11R22.5G MICHELIN XDN2 (23360 LBS. GAWR) LONG / REGIONAL

6.32 |HAUL $ 930.00( $ -
094788 11R22.5G MICHELIN X LINE ENERGY Z (23360 LBS. GAWR) LONG7/

6.33 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 835.00( $ -
094588 11R22.5G MICHELIN XZE2 (23360 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL / URBAN

634 |USAGE $ 635.00|% =
094692 71R22.5G MICHELIN X MULTI ENERGY D (23360 LBS. GAWR)

6.35 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 965.00( $ -
094674 [T1R22.5H BRIDGESTONE M770 (24020 LBS. GAWR) LONG /

6.36 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 465.00 | $ -
094559 11R22.5H BRIDGESTONE M775 (24020 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

6.37 |USAGE $ 889.00| $ -
094311 11R22.5H BRIDGESTONE M843 (24020 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

6.38 |USAGE $ 915.00( $ =
094738 11R22.5H BRIDGESTONE R268 (24020 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL /

6.39 |URBAN USAGE $ 465.00 | $ -
094688 11R22.5H BRIDGESTONE M799 (24020 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

6.40 |USAGE $ 565.00 | $ -
094760 11R22.5H GOODYEAR G731 MSA (24020 LBS. GAWR) MULTI

6.41 USAGE $ 2,47000($ -
094762 11R22.5H GOODYEAR G751 MSA (24020 LBS. GAWR) MULTI

642 |USAGE $ 2,355.00($ -
094351 11R22.5H MICHELIN XDN2 (24020 LBS. GAWR) LONG / REGIONAL

6.43 |HAUL $ 1,015.00| $ 1,015.00
094652 11R22.5H MICHELIN XDS2 (24020 LBS. GAWR) LONG / REGIONAL

6.44 |HAUL $ 1,485.00($ -
094789 11R22.5H MICHELIN X LINE ENERGY Z (24020 LBS. GAWR) LONG /

6.45 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 955.00 | $ -
094801 11R22.5H MICHELIN X WORKS Z (24020 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF

6.46 |ROAD USAGE $ 1,34500($ -
094686 11R22.5H MICHELIN X WORKS XDY (24020 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF

6.47 |ROAD USAGE $ 1,485.00($ -
094677 11R24.5G BRIDGESTONE M770 (24020 LBS. GAWR) LONG /

6.48 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 500.00 | $ -
094811 11R24.5G BRIDGESTONE M726 EL A (22700 LBS. GAWR) LONG /

6.49 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 250.00( $ -
094739 11R24.5G BRIDGESTONE R268 (24020 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL /

6.50 |URBAN USAGE $ 400.00( $ -
094361 11R24.5G MICHELIN XDN2 (24020 LBS. GAWR) LONG / REGIONAL

6.51 |HAUL $ 1,185.00|$ -
094557 11R24.5H BRIDGESTONE L320 (26440 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

652 |USAGE $ 1,31500($ -
094558 11R24.5H BRIDGESTONE M775 (26440 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

6.53 |USAGE $ 1,52500($ -
094299 11R24.5H BRIDGESTONE M843 (26440 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

654 |USAGE $ 1,185.00( $ -
094741 11R24.5H BRIDGESTONE R268 (26440 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL /

655 |URBAN USAGE $ 685.00( $ -
094689 11R24.5H BRIDGESTONE M799 (26440 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

656 |USAGE $ 685.00 | $ c
094761 11R24.5H GOODYEAR G731 MSA (26440 LBS. GAWR) MULTI

657 |USAGE $ 2845.00($ -
094763 11R24.5H GOODYEAR G751 MSA (26440 LBS. GAWR) MULTI

6.58 |USAGE $ 265500|% -
094659 11R24.5H MICHELIN XDS2 (26440 LBS. GAWR) LONG / REGIONAL

659 [HAUL $ 1,460.00|$ =
094804 11R24.5H MICHELIN X WORKS Z (26440 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF

660 |ROAD USAGE $ 1,680.00($ -
094671 11R24.5H MICHELIN X WORKS XDY (26440 LBS. GAWR) LIGHT

661 |CONSTRUCTION $ 1,795.00($ -
094560 12R22.5H BRIDGESTONE M775 (27120 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

662 |USAGE $ 1,690.00|$ -
094690 12R22.5H BRIDGESTONE M799 (27120 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD

663 |USAGE $ 1,825.00($ "
094764 12R22.5H GOODYEAR G751 MSA (27120 LBS. GAWR) MULTI

664 |USAGE $ 3,195.00|$ =
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094314 12R24.5H BRIDGES TONE M843 (28640 LBS. GAWR) ON/OFF ROAD
665 |USAGE $ 1,46500|$ *
094330 275/80R22.5G MICHELIN XDA ENERGY (22700 LBS. GAWR) LONG /
6.66 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 895.00 =
094700 275/80R22.5G MICHELIN X LINE ENERGY D (22700 LBS. GAWR)
6.67 |[LONG /REGIONAL HAUL $ 855.00| $ -
094698 275/80R22.5G MICHELIN XDA5+ (22700 LBS. GAWR) LONG /
6.68 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 665.00 | $ =
094354 275/80R22.5G MICHELIN XDN2 (22700 LBS. GAWR) LONG /
6.69 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 750.00 | $ -
094787 275/80R22.56G MICHELIN X LINE ENERGY Z (22700 LBS. GAWR)
6.70 |[LONG / REGIONAL HAUL $ 715.00 | $ -
094694 275/80R22.56G MICHELIN X MULTT ENERGY D (22700 LBS. GAWR)
6.71 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 1,050.00|$ -
094592 275/80R22.5G MICHELIN XZE2 (22700 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL /
6.72 |URBAN USAGE $ 545.00 | $ -
094790 275/80R22.56H MICHELIN X LINE ENERGY Z (26440 LBS. GAWR)
6.73 |LONG / REGIONAL HAUL $ 875.00| $ =
094699 275/80R24.5G MICHELIN XDA5+ (22700 LBS. GAWR) LONG /
6.74 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 600.00 | $ -
094490 275/80R24.5G MICHELIN XDN2 (22700 LBS. GAWR) LONG /
6.75 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 800.00| $ -
094791 275/80R24.5G MICHELIN X LINE ENERGY Z (22700 LBS. GAWR)
6.76  |LONG / REGIONAL HAUL $ 750.00 | $ -
094809 285/75R24.5G BRIDGESTONE M726 EL A (20820 LBS. GAWRY)
6.77 |LONG / REGIONAL HAUL $ 230.00( $ -
094676 285/75R24.5G BRIDGESTONE M770 (22700 LBS. GAWR) LONG /
6.78 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 285.00| $ -
094808 205/75R22.5G BRIDGESTONE M726 EL A (20280 LBS. GAWR)
6.79 |LONG / REGIONAL HAUL $ 75.00| $ -
094725 295/75R22.56G BRIDGES TONE R268 (22700 LBS. GAWR) REGIONAL
6.80 |HAUL $ 95.00| $ 5
094767 295/75R22.5G CONTINENTAL HDR2 (22700 LBS. GAWR)
6.81 |REGIONAL HAUL $ 155.00 | $ -
NUS225 6.82 |Steel spare rim, size No Bid
NUS245 6.83 |Steel spare rim, size No Bid
70 BRAKE SYSTEM OPTIONS:
VHXBVX 71 |Wabco System Saver 1200 Plus heated air dryer STD
UWXB1X 7.2 |Manual cable drain valves on air tanks $ 27.00 | $ -
N/A 7.3 |Heated air tank No Bid
UWXE3X 7.4 |Auto drain valves on air tanks, heated $ 48.00 | § -
300AD0 75 |MGM type TR-T rear brake chambers $ 48.00 | $ =
A 7 S.S. pins on slack adjuster yoke (2 ea. per yoke)
’ For all air brake chambers No Bid
NSFAJX 7.7 |Inverted rear brake chamber mounting in lieu of regular mounting No Bid
MC 7.8 |Relocate air dryer $ 272.00 | $ =
80 ENGINE/EXHAUST AND FUEL TANKS OPTIONS:
(List Make & Model, H.P., torque of engine and exhaust and fuel
tank options)
1017V0 81  |VOLVO D11 325HP 2100RPM 1250 LBFT STD
1017V1 82 |VOLVO D11 355HP 2100RPM 1250 LBFT $ 1,230.00($ -
1017V2 83 [VOLVO D11 365HP 2100RPM 1350 LBFT $ 167500($ -
1017V3 84 (VOLVO D11 385HP 2100RPM 1450 LBFT $ 2413.00]$ =
1017V5 85 [VOLVO D11 425HP 2100RPM 1550 LBFT $ 3971.00|$ -
1017v4 86 |VOLVO D11 385HP 2100RPM 1450/1250 LBFT ECO-TORQUE PERF $ 2413.00|$ &
1017V6 87 |VOLVO D11 425HP 2100RPM 1550/1350 LBFT ECO-TORQUE PERF $ 3971.00|$% -
1017W0 88 [VOLVO D13 375HP 2100RPM 1450 LBFT $ 2,22000($ -
1017W1 89  |VOLVO D13 405HP 2100RPM 1450 LBFT $ 3,283.00|$% -
1017W8 810 [VOLVO D13 425HP 2100RPM 1550 LBFT $ 4,43200|9% 4,432.00
1017X7 811 [VOLVO D13 435HP 2100RPM 1650 LBFT $ 4,99400]|$ -
1017X8 812 [VOLVO D13 455HP 2100RPM 1750 LBFT $ 5649.00|$ -
1017Y7 813 |VOLVO D13 500HP 2100RPM 1850 LBFT $ 712900|$ -
1017W2 8.14  |VOLVO D13 405HP 2100RPM 1450/1650 LBFT DUAL-TORQUE $ 3,58800($ -
1017W9 8.15 [VOLVO D13 425HP 2100RPM 1450/1750 LBFT DUAL-TORQUE $ 4,736.00| % -
1017X9 8.16 |VOLVO D13 455HP 2100RPM 1550/1850 LBFT DUAL-TORQUE $ 6,000.00|$ -
1017W3 8.17 |VOLVO D13 405HP 2100RPM 1650/1450 LBFT ECO-TORQUE PERF. $ 3588.00($ -
1017W4 8.18 |ECON. $ 3588.00($% =
1017X0 819 [VOLVO D13 425HP 2100RPM 1750/1450 LBFT ECO-TORQUE PERF. $ 4736.00|$% -
1017X1 820 |VOLVO D13 425HP 2100RPM 1750/1450 LBFT ECO-TORQUE ECON $ 4,736.00($ -
821 [VOLVO D13 455HP 2100RPM 1850/1550 LBFT ECO-TORQUE
1017Y0 PERFORMANCE $ 6,000.00( $ -
1017Y1 822 |VOLVO D13 455HP 2100RPM 1850/1550 LBFT ECO-TORQUE ECON $ 6,000.00| $ -
1017Y8 823 [VOLVO D13 500HP 2100RPM 1850/1550 LBFT ECO-TORQUE PERF. $ 712900($ -
232088 824 [10' 0" ALUMINIZED STAINLESS VERTICAL STEEL SINGLE STACK STD
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KOXC1X 825 [STRAIGHT END EXHAUST STACK $ 45.00( $ -
KOXD1X 826 |TURNED OUT EXHAUST EXTENSION integrated DPF and SCR 118 979.00| $ 979.00
KOXC4X 827 |STRAIGHT STACK, SIDE OUTLET DIFFUSER BOX 1 STD
KOXC5X 828 STRAIGHT STACK, TOP OUTLET DIFFUSER BOX $ 45.00| $ -
JBXATX 829 |50 GALLON LEFT HAND FUEL TANK $ 132.00| $ -
JBXBXX 8.30 |70 GALLON LEFT HAND FUEL TANK $ 132.00| $ -
JBXB1X 8.31 |75 GALLON LEFT HAND FUEL TANK STANDARD 0 STD
JBXEJX 8.32 190 GALLON LEFT HAND FUEL TANK 1189 560.00 | $ 560.00
JBXEWX 8.33 1100 GALLON LEFT HAND FUEL TANK $ 137.00| $ -
JBXG1X 8.34 1125 GALLON LEFT HAND FUEL TANK $ 301.00| $ -
JBZZ1234 22" DIA'D SHAPED FUEL TANK **Required for CBOC™ air tanks
8.35 |needs moved 119 601.00 | $ 601.00 includes double step
KNXB2X 8.36 [26" DIA D SHAPED FUEL TANK $ 186.00 | $ -
9.0 ENGINE RELATED OPTIONS:
26X1XZ 9.1 Oil fill and dipstick EZ access $ 319.00( $ -
PJXMGX 9.2 |Delco 35 S| Brushless Alternator, 135 AMP $ (44.00)| $ -
NA 9.3 |Delco 24 S| Alternator, 130 AMP 1 STD 160a
PJXMLX 9.4  |Delco 24 S| Alternator, 145 AMP $ (50.00)( $ -
PJXMIX 9.5 |Leece-Neville Alternator, 145 AMP $ (35.00)| $ =
810113 9.6 |3 Volvo 760 CCA Maintenance Free 12V Batteries 2280 CCA 1189 80.00| $ 80.00
KWXA3X 9.7  |Dual element air cleaner $ 66.00 | $ -
KWXA1A 9.8 Donaldson Single Stage Air cleaner per spec 12.1 $ 32.00| $ -
JVXDAX 9.9  [Davco 382 fuel/water separator, non heated 118 196.00 | $ 196.00 heated
JVXBBX 9.10  [Non-heated fuel/water separator, ___ RACOR 6903E_(Brand) $ 42.00| $ -
HOXK1X 9.1 |Coolant spin on filter/conditioner $ 67.00| $ -
T1IXA1X 9.12  |Front engine powered take off adapter and radiator cut out $ 540.00 | $ -
208021 9.13  |Air applied fan drive, KYSOR_(Brand) $ 329.00| $ -
208025 9.14 [Viscous fan drive $ 29.00( $ -
KOXD1X 9.15 |Curved exhaust pipe end $ 24.00| $ -
SNXAVX 9.16  |Engine block heater 0]$ 60.00 | $ =
NA 9.17  |In line fuel heater No Bid
JRXA1X 9.18 |In tank fuel heater $ 388.00( $ -
NA 9.19  |Fuel cooler No Bid
NA 9.20 |Radiator bug screen 1 STD
LCOo1 9.21 |Stainless Steel Oil Pan 11%$ 1,90000]|$ 1,900.00
HTXA8X 9.22 |Engine brake system 118 950.00( $ 950.00
VHXZZX 9.23 |Relocate air dryer $ 243.00( $ -
K9X09X 9.24 |Extended life anti-freeze 118 126.00 | $ 126.00
UBXM1X 925 |ENGINE MOUNTED HYDRAULIC PUMP PARKER F2-42/42 $ 2,72400($ =
UBXD1X 9.26 |ENGINE MOUNTED HYDRAULIC PUMP PARKER F1-81 $ 1,969.00]|$ -
UBXC1X 9.27  [ENGINE MOUNTED HYDRAULIC PUMP PARKER F1-61 $ 1,881.00]$ -
REAR ENGINE MOUNTED PTO WITH SPLINED SHAFT GROOVE
TIXK1X 9.28 |FEMALE DIN 5462 $ 349.00| $ -
NCXD1X 9.29 |VOLVO 12 V GEAR REDUCTION STARTER (MODEL 105P55) $ 92.00| $ -
HOOD MOUNTED AIR INTAKE WITH INSIDE/OUTSIDE AIR IN CAB
JWXE1X 9.30 [CONTROL SNOW DOOR 0189 173.00] $ =
TIXA1X 931 |REAR ENGINE POWER TAKE OFF WITH FLANGE SAE 1410 $ 540.00 | $ -
NCXA5X 9.32 |Starter motor options **DELCO REMY 12 39MTHD STARTER $ 98.00| $ -
HOXK1X 9.33  [1240 SQ IN RADIATOR 2 ROW CORE 118 225.00( $ 225.00
10.0 TRANSMISSION OPTIONS:
(After the first Six listed options, list manual and automatic
transmission options. List make and model, # of speeds, type of
shifting and whether or not transmission includes PTO gear(s) or
not). Example: Allison 3000 HS, 5 speed, push button, no PTO.
NA 10.1 |2 plate 14" ceramic clutch option for manual transmission No Bid
250090 10.2 |2 plate 15%2" ceramic clutch option for manual transmission No Bid
RBXA1A 10.3  |External grease fitting for throw out bearing $ 103.00| $ -
NA 104  |Adjustment free option for 2 plate clutches 1 STD
NA 105 |Synthetic (TranSynd) lubrication for Automatic Transmission 118 145.00| $ 145.00
Loc002 106 [Stainless Steel Transmission cooler lines 11$ 195000|$ 1,950.00
NA 10.7  [Synthetic lubrication for Manual Transmission ] STD
****% VOLVO AUTOMATED MANUAL TRANSMISSIONS
V -SHI V , AT2612F DIRECT DRIVE, 12
270707 108 |SPEED $ 2,34400($ =
270708 1109 |VOLVO I-SHIFT FOR SEVERE DUTY, ATO2612F, 12 SPEED $ 2344.00] % -
270711 10.10  |VOLVO I-SHIFT WITH CRAWLER, ATO2612F, 13 SPEED $ 4,566.00( $ -
[VOLVO I-SHIFT WITH ULTRA-LOW CRAWLER, ATO2612F, 14
270714 1011 |SPEED $ 4566.00|% =
FEEREREEEE MANUAL TRANSMISSIONS
[ 270721 —| 10.12 [EATON FULLER ADVANTAGE FAO15810C, 10 SPEED | $ 989.00[ $ -
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270722 1013 [EATON FULLER ADVANTAGE FAO16810C, 10 SPEED $ 1,103.00($ -
270733 10.17 |EATON FULLER FRO-15210C, 10 SPEED $ (257.00)| $ -
270734 10.18 [EATON FULLER FRO-16210C, 10 SPEED $ 561.00| $ -
270735 10.19 |EATON FULLER FRO-17210C, 10 SPEED $ 899.00| $ -
270737 1021 |EATON FULLER RTO-14908LL, 10 SPEED $ 1,262.00($ -
270738 1022 |EATON FULLER RTO-16908LL, 10 SPEED $ 1.358.00|$% -
270739 1023 |EATON FULLER RTO-14909ALL, 11 SPEED $ 1826.00]|$% -
270740 1024 |EATON FULLER RTO-16909ALL, 11 SPEED $ 1,928.00|$ -
270743 1025 |EATON FULLER RTLO-16913A, 13 SPEED $ 1,239.00($ -
270744 1026 |EATON FULLER RTLO-18913A, 13 SPEED $ 1,755.00($ #
270747 1027 [EATON FULLER RTLO-16918B, 18 SPEED $ 182600|$% -
270748 1028 [EATON FULLER RTLO-18918B, 18 SPEED $ 1826.00|$% =
**++% FULLY AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSIONS
270762 ALLISON 3000 RDS SERIES 5 SPEED WITH PTO PROVISION - SCAAN REQUIRED
1020 |BEFORE ORDERING $3.113.00 |$ =
LLISON 4000 RDS SERIES 6 SPEED WITH PTO PROVISION -
270765 1030 |SCAAN REQUIRED BEFORE ORDERING $7,410.00 | $ -
ALLISON 4500 RDS SERIES 5 SPEED WITH PTO PROVISION -
270768 1031 |SCAAN REQUIRED BEFORE ORDERING $7,586.00 | $ -
ALLISON 4500 RDS SERIES 6 SPEED WITH PTO PROVISION -
270769 10.32 |SCAAN REQUIRED BEFORE ORDERING $ 8,086.00 | $ 8,086.00
TKXB1X 10.34 |UPGRADE DRIVELINE ONE SIZE $ 107.00| $ -
TKXC1X 10.35 |UPGRADE DRIVELINE TWO SIZES $ 127.00| $ -
T4XAKX 1036 |REAR TRANSMISSION PTO, SAE 1310 FLANGE LOW SPEED $ 251300|$% -
REAR TRANSMISSION PTO, DIN-CONNECTION PUMP MEDIUM
T4XDMX 1037 |SPEED $ 2,108.00($ -
[REAR TRANS PTO, HEAVY DUTY, SAE 1350 / 1410 FLANGE HIGH
T4XF1X 10.38 |SPEED $ 2,053.00($% -
REAR DOUBLE TRANS PTO, HEAVY DUTY, (1) SAE 1350/ 1410
T4XH1X 1039 |FLANGE HIGH SPEED + (1) DIN-CONNECTION PUMP HIGH SPEED $ 2,399.00($ -
REAR TRIPLE TRANS PTO, HEAVY DUTY, (1) SAE 1310 FLANGE
LOW SPEED + (1) SAE 1350/1410 FLANGE HIGH SPEED + (1) DIN-
T4xJ1X 10.40 |CONN. PUMP HIGH SPEED $ 3,184.00| $ -
REAR DOUBLE TRANS PTO, HEAVY DUTY, (2) DIN-CONN. PUMPS
T4XG1X 1041 |HIGH SPEED $ 1,864.00( % -
T4XD5X 1042 |TRANSMISSION PTO PREP ELECTRIC / AIR SOLENOID $ 25.00| $ -
RVXH5X 1043 |GEAR SHIFT LEVER, PREMIUM, |-Shift $ 25.00| $ -
RVXH4X 1044 [GEAR SHIFT LEVER, DASH MOUNTED, PREMIUM, VOLVO I-SHIFT $ 145.00| $ -
INTER 1045 |Local Change to Allison Programming - Performance Mode $ 1,450.00|$ -
11.0 ELECTRICAL OPTIONS:
NA 111 |Resettable circuit breaker electrical protection No Bid
NA 112 |Automatic reset circuit breakers No Bid
NA 11.3  |Solid state circuit protection No Bid
L1XB1X 114 |Circuit box under hood or end of frame, each No Bid
NFXD1X 115 |Battery disconnect off negative side in cab control $ 10.00| $ =
NZzZD1X 116 |Remote jump start terminals $ 345.00 | $ -
5RXA1X 11.7  |Back up alarm (Preco Factory Model) $ 23.00| $ 23.00
LSXG1X 11.8 |OEM daytime running lights STD
NA 11.10 |Battery box aft of cab $ 178.00 | $ -
NA 1111 |Grote 44710 flasher No Bid
NPXB1X 11.12  |Signal Stat 935 turn signal per Spec 12.6 STD
NZzACZ 1113 |Auxiliary customer access circuits STD
witch for snowplow lights mounted on instrumental panel. Includes
wiring terminated near headlights, for customer mounted auxiliary
NJXAAX 1114 |snowplow lights. $ 78.00( $ 78.00
Power source terminal-2 stud type-mounted on firewall or inside cab
NZZAAX 11.15 |with ground to frame rail and to starter, with 6 gauge wire. $ 76.00| $ -
T0-position switch panel mounted on instrument panel. Includes 10
lighted switches, ignition control; switches will control relays which will
EAXABX 11.16 |feed stud type juction block mounted inside cab. $ 663.00 | $ 663.00
Vehicle speed sensor with speed signal at fuse panel for sander ground
NZZABZ 11.17 |speed control system. $ 456.00 | $ 456.00
120 CAB EXTERIOR OPTIONS:
LZXD1X 122 |Air horns, dual, round, with snow shields $ 165.00 | $ -
NA 123 |Dual rectangular air horns $ 165.00 | $ 165.00
EDXB1X 124  |Fender mirrors per Spec 12.4 $ 68.00( $ -
3GXB1X 125 |Heated mirrors per Spec 12.5 $ 99.00| $ 99.00
NA 126 |Remote control for R.H. mirror No Bid
3GXC1X 127 |Remote control for dual mirrors $ 167.00( $ 167.00
NA 128 |Upcharge for cab extension or larger cab No Bid
NA 129 |Severe duty aluminum cab option No Bid
9801S0 1210 |Dupont Highway orange paint or equal $ 249.00| $ 249.00

5 switches available
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955043 1211 [Premium paint color option $ 138.00 | $ .
955040 1212 |lmron paint option 1 STD
955041 1213 |Imron and clear coat paint option $ 152.00| $ -
9811C2 1214 | Top of hood painted flat black 0f$ 467.00 | $ -
2DX30X 12.15 |Cab Air Ride Suspension 1 STD
28XC1X 1216 [Tilting hood per Spec 12.8 $ 367.00| $ .
NA 12.17  |Butterfly option on hood $ 378.00| $ -
NA 12.18 |Transverse hood opening w/setback axle No Bid
NA 12.19  |Front fender mounted turn signals No Bid
4ANXZ1X 12.20 |Cab visor, external, painted to match cab color 118 185.00 | $ 185.00
65XA1X 1221 [Front fender extensions 118 85.00( $ 85.00
NA 1222 |Front fender mud flaps $ 22.00| $ -
D2XB1X 12.23  [Arctic winter wiper blades 119 17.00| $ 17.00
NA 12.24 |Optional windshield washer tank No Bid
20XB1X -12.25  |Per truck charge for all trucks, key identical $ 25.00| $ -
NA 12.26 |RH observation prism window in door No Bid
NA 12.27  |Spotlight LH, RH, or roof mounted each No Bid
4EXB1X 12.28 |Front tow hooks $ 231.00( $ -
6PXB1X 1229 |Rear tow hooks $ 85.00| $ -
3FX49X 1230 |BLACK AERODYNAMIC EXTERIOR MIRRORS $ 146.00 | $ »
EDXB7X 1231 |Heated fender mirrors 118 446.00 | $ 446.00
WTXA1X 1232 |HEATED WINDSHIELD 118 210.00( $ 210.00
13.0 CAB INTERIOR OPTIONS:
540068 131 |Medium grade interior trim package $ 110.00| $ 2
540070 132  [Premium grade interior trim package 118 150.00 | $ 150.00
NA 133 |Round universal gauge package 1 STD
2XX30X 134  |Power window, passenger side $ 81.00| $ <
2XX35X 135 |Power window/both passenger and driver window 118 150.00| $ 150.00
MmC 136 |O.E.M factory installed, AM/FM 1 STD
NA 137 |O.E.M factory installed, air conditioning **STANDARD 1 STD
NA 138 |Cab mounted non-resettable hour meter **STANDARD 1 STD
571018 139 |Dash mounted air cleaner air restriction gauge $ 78.00| $ =
CCXB1X 13.10  |[Transmission temp gauges 118 79.00( $ 79.00
NA 13.11  [Windshield defroster fan w/switch dash mounted 1 STD
NA 1312 |Between seats mounted console $ 16.00 | $ -
NA 13.13 | Transmission oil sensor (check & fill) 1 STD
5JXA1X 13.14  |CB hot jacks dash mounted 119 26.00 | $ 26.00
2WXA1X 13.15 |Tilt & telescope steering wheel $ 190.00 | $ -
2WZZ1X 13.16 |Tilt steering wheel 1 STD
2WXA1X 13.17 |SRS DRIVER SIDE AIR BAG IN STEERING WHEEL 118 138.00| $ 138.00
WPXA1X 13.18 |TRACTION CONTROL ADDED TO ABS 1 1S 138.00 | $ 138.00
13.19 |Self canceling turn signals 1 STD
List seating options for driver and passenger seats. Use as many
options as you need to offer seat variations customers have been
buying.
INTERIOR TRIM LEVELS
540066 13.22 [X1 WREN VINYL TRIM PACKAGE 0 STD
540068 13.23 |X2 Raven Cloth TRIM PACKAGE $120.00 $ -
540067 1324 [X3 WREN CLOTH WITH MIGRATION PATTERN $120.00 $ =
540070 13.25 (X4 RAVEN MORDURA CLOTH $195.00 $ -
540069 1326 |X5 WREN VINYL / WREN CLOTH 118 195.00 | $ 195.00
540072 13.27  |X7 WREN LEATHER $345.00 $ 2
540071 1328 |X6 WREN LEATHER / WREN CLOTH WITH ORANGE ACCENT $195.00 $ e
SEAT MANUFACTURER $ -
35XD1X 13.29 |NATIONAL SEAT 1 STD
35XB1X 1330 |BOSTROM SEAT $ 50.00 | $ E
35XH1X 1331 |SEARS SEAT $ 55.00( $ =
13.32 |DRIVER SEAT TYPE $ -
3YXF2X 13.33 |AIR SUSPENSION HIGH BACK $ 35.00| $ -
3YXG8X 13.34 |COMFORT AIR SUSPENSION HIGH BACK 0|$ 69.00 | $ -
3YXGOX 1335 |COMFORT AIR SUSPENSION HIGH BACK, HEATED $ 112.00| $ =
3YXJ1X 1336 |COMFORT AIR SUSPENSION HIGH BACK WITH BACK CYCLER 1189 25.00( $ 25.00
PASSENGER SEAT TYPE $ _
32X40X 13.38  |STATIONARY BENCH SEAT WITH TOOL BOX 0[$ 375.00( $ 5
32XF3X 13.39 |AIR SUSPENSION HIGH BACK 0|$ 148.00 | $ =
32XG8X 1340 |COMFORT AIR SUSPENSION HIGH BACK $ 214.00( $ &
32XGOX 1341 |COMFORT AIR SUSPENSION HIGH BACK, HEATED $ 228.00| $ -
32XJ1X 1342 |COMFORT AIR SUSPENSION HIGH BACK WITH BACK CYCLER $ 368.00 | $ =
32X99X 1342 |NO PASSENGER SEAT PROVIDED $ (58.00)| $ -

include extention

8" only

stationary pass seat
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SEAT ARMREST $ =
3PXZ1X 1343 |NO SEAT ARMREST PROVIDED $ (5.00)| $ -
3PXA1X 1343 |INBOARD DRIVER SEAT ARMREST $ 19.00| $ -
3PXA5X 1343 [INBOARD / OUTBOARD DRIVER SEAT ARMREST $ 38.00| $ -
3PXC1X 1343 |INBOARD DRIVER AND PASS SEAT ARMREST $ 38.00| $ -

TNBOARD / OUTBOARD DRIVER AND PASSENGER SEAT
3PXCBX 1343 |ARMREST $ 76.00| § -

SAFETY BELT LENGTH $ =
K7AA1X 1344 |STANDARD SAFETY BELT LENGTH STD
K7AC1X 1345 |EXTENDED SAFETY BELT LENGTH $ 50.00 | $ 50.00

SAFETY BELT DRIVER SEAT $ g
OUXA1X 1346 |SAFETY BELT DRIVER SEAT, BLACK STD
OUXC1X 1347 |SAFETY BELT DRIVER SEAT, ORANGE $ 8.00| $ 8.00
OUXD1X 1348 |SAFETY BELT DRIVER SEAT, LIME GREEN $ 10.00| $ -

SAFETY BELT PASSENGER SEAT $ e
OXXA1X 1349 |SAFETY BELT PASSENGER SEAT, BLACK STD
OXXA2X 1350 |SAFETY BELT PASSENGER SEAT, ORANGE $ 8.00
OXXATX 1351 |SAFETY BELT PASSENGER SEAT, LIME GREEN $ 10.00

140 MN/DOT OPTIONS:

141 |Additional warranty coverage per spec 12.9
M510Z1 142 |Engine Plan 2 60 months 250,000 miles $ 2910.00($ -
M51131 143 |Engine Plan 2 72 months 250,000 miles $ 4690.00($ a
M51141 144 |Engine Plan 2 84 months 250,000 miles $ 6,270.00 | $ -
M511B1 145 [Engine Plan 2 60 months 250,000 miles - HP over 460 horses $ 4,308.00|$ -
M511F1 146 |Engine Plan 2 72 months 250,000 miles - HP over 460 horses $ 6,961.00 | $ -
511G1 147 |Engine Plan 2 84 months 250,000 miles - HP over 460 horses $ 941400 9% -
M53083 14.8  |Engine after-treatment systems (EATS) 60 months 250,000 miles $ 942.00 | $ -
M530Y3 149 |Engine after-treatment systems (EATS) 72 months 250,000 miles $ 1,708.00 | § -
M53103 1410 |Engine after-treatment systems (EATS) 84 months 250,000 miles $ 227400|$ -
oa0es 1441 Engine after-treatment systems (EATS) 60 months 250,000 miles - HP

) over 460 horses $ 1,566.00 | $ -

Ma30Y3 14,43 Engine after-treatment systems (EATS) 72 months 250,000 miles - HP

over 460 horses $ 2,087.00($% -

SIS 49 Engine after-treatment systems (EATS) 84 months 250,000 miles - HP
’ over 460 horses $ 2,408.00 | § “
M54174 14.14 |iShift HD Transmission 48 months 500,000 miles $ 2,166.00 | $ -
M54184 14.15  [iShift HD Transmission 60 months 500,000 miles $ 3216008 -
N/A 14.15 |Allison 60 month unlimited mileage Extended Warranty $ 1312009 -
MS560A6 14.16 |HVAC (Air Conditioning) 60 months $ 840.00 | $ =
M59089 1417 |Starter 60 months 300,000 miles $ 282.00 | $ s
M60080 14.18  |Alternator 60 months 300,000 miles $ 324.00 [ $ =
M61071 14.19 |Starter & Alternator 60 months 300,000 miles $ 438.00 | $ g

14.20 Prebuild specification meeting (per person) to be held in St.

Paul/Minneapolis area. $ 1.00 | § -
14.21 |Pilot inspection meeting (per person). $ 2,250.00 | $ -

TRAILER TOW OPTIONS:

MC 151 |Trailer tow package extended to rear of frame $ 636.00( $ -
MmC 152 |Trailer package extend to rear of frame per Spec 12.12 $ 947.00( $ -

MANUALS / INTEREST FEE:

Percent interest per month (non-compounding) on unpaid cab & chassis

balance. Applies only to CPV Members. (Payable after trade-in is

16.0 |delivered to vendor). Percentage/per month. $ -

16.1 SEE Exhibit C : Specifications re interest to State agencies.

162 |Premium Tech Tool [$ 4000.00] s -
Delivery Charges:

17.0 |Price per loaded mile Starting Point

17.1. |Roseville $ 250 | % -
Maintenance/ Body Shop Labor rates

18.0 |Rate for Initial Inspection/Diagnostic $ 195.00 | $ .

18.1 |Rate for Mechanical Work $ 195.00 | $ -

182 |Rate for Body Work $ 195.00 | $ -

Quantity Discounts:

Enter the number of units that must be purchased and the

corresponding discount offered to the purchaser. More than one

19.0 |quantity discount may be entered. $ -

Next Model Year Upcharges
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20.0  (Enter the following Production Model Year here  >>>>>>>>> 2026

20.1 |Percentage Upcharge for the following Model Year Base Unit 3.00%| $ 3,767.37

202 |Percentage Upcharge for the following Model Year Options 3.00%| $ 967.74

20.3 |Rate for Body Work $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00

204 |Enter the following Production Model Year here >>>>>>>>> 2027

205 |Percentage Upcharge for the following Model Year Base Unit 3.00%| $ 3,767.37

206 |Percentage Upcharge for the following Model Year Options 3.00%| $ 967.74
Total $  170,807.22



2M (10)
CITY OF

% Monticello

VERBAL/WRITTEN QUOTE SUMMARY SHEET

Minimum 2 verbal or written quotes required for items/services costing at least $2,500 but less than
$9,999. Minimum 3 written quotes required for items /services costing at least $10,000 but less than
$24,999.

No Quotes are required for items purchased through state cooperative purchasing venture.

Use this form to summarize quotes received and to select vendor for award.

Name: Ml e HO\-&\OJ\ é/ Dept: S}"(’tLA" b(ﬁs“ Phone: 263 Q271 3377
Signature of Person Obtaining Quotes: /,774.3% g, %“M

Item/Service Requested: P\ oW EQOTPNV\ 4 ,/ c\, u‘vw]f\ t)é k‘é——
E&ﬁBudgeted OUnbudgeted

Note: If you are unable to obtain required number of quotes, provide an explanation below in notes/comments.

# Date Vendor Name Contact Person Phone Number Total $ Amount
Quoted

Llgsepkas) Towhastor I mugl Bvlsed | 230 ¢43 7900 #ara, 392,00

Selected Vendor: 1 0W &S 3’01"

(If you are selecting other than low quote, you are required to provide written justification as to why low quote
was not selected in the notes/comments section):

Notes/comments:

Skche Conbmc Plcing

Approval Acknowledgement: Date:

Attach this form and written quotes obtained to invoice. Questions may be directed to the
Finance Department.

Quote Summary Sheet 03/21/2025
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TRUCK EQUIPMENT Reference No.
TOWMASTER, 61381 US HWY 12, LITCHFIELD, MN 55355

PH: 320-693-7900 FX: 320-693-7921 TF: B00-462-4517 QT 98109
TOWMASTERTRUCK.COM
** QUOTATION **
Ship To: Cust: 3249 Phone: Bill To: Phone:
MONTICELLO, CITY OF MONTICELLO, CITY OF
505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1 505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1
MONTICELLO MN 55362 USA MONTICELLO MN 55362

ATTN: MATT BARTHEL

Salesman Terms Created Last Revised  Appx Comp
JOSH PAULSON NET 30 DAYS 9/05/25 9/05/25 0/00/00
Serial No.
Qty Part No. Description Price Ea. Net Amt.
1 9900140 - Body 14'6" EDGE-RS/CS-56-46-46 - - 56" 7ga Stainless Front $27,078.00 $27,078.00

w/CS hoist doghouse, 46" 7ga Stainless radius sides (no pocke
ts), 46" 7ga Stainless w/Hardox 450 face Tailgate, 1/4" Hardox-450
Floor, 8" I-Beam Longsills, Air-trip ready linkage, Underside Black

1 9901701 - Installation of Dump Body to hoist $2,420.00 $2,420.00
1 9900145 - Body acc'y TMTE Air trip kit, w/solenoid valve $505.00 $505.00
1 9901702 - Installation of air operated tailgate latch kit, with $472.00 $472.00

solenoid valve in hydraulic valve enclosure.

1 9900147 - Body acc Box Vibrator - Cougar model DC3200 $866.00 $866.00

1 9901703 - Installation of Box Vibrator, with solenoid located in $549.00 $549.00
hydraulic valve enclosure.

1 9900149 - Body acc'y MUDFLAPS, FRONT (of driver wheels) w/ brkts $621.00 $621.00
installed
1 9906172 - Cabshield, 1/2 type Stationary Free-Standing style, for $4,805.00 $4,805.00

VERTICAL VALVE w/plain STAINLESS STEEL canopy, Hot-Dipped
Galvanized Modular Channel support stand, Slotted Center Viewing
Window, (2) shovel holders, & reservior mounts, Installed.

1 9900207 - Ladder Flip-A-Way Access ladder (STAINLESS STEEL) Including $731.00 $731.00
Grab Handle above, and Interior Step, ea, Installed
SPECIFY LOCATION HERE: LH FRONT

1 9900211 - Body acc'y Dual "split" sander manifolds in rear corner $550.00 $550.00
posts

*-—-- Continued ---%*

Price:

Total Discounts:
Date

Accepte(; by ; Net Cost:
W Z W (f( Se!x\»g,(,&g Freight

Total:

TRKQT3MOD022324
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TRUCK EQUIPMENT Reference No.
TOWMASTER, 61381 US HWY 12, LITCHFIELD, MN 55355

PH: 320-693-7900 FX: 320-693-792] TF: 800-462-4517 QT 98109
TOWMASTERTRUCK,COM
** QUOTATION **
Ship To: Cust: 3249  Phone: Bill To: Phone:
MONTICELLO, CITY OF MONTICELLO, CITY OF
505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1 505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1
MONTICELLO MN 55362 USA MONTICELLO MN 55362

ATTN: MATT BARTHEL

Salesman Created Last Revised  Appx Comp
JOSH PAULSON NET 30 DAYS 9/05/25 9/05/25 0/00/00

Serial No.

1 9904963 - Light Warning TMTE1SSM-3 PKG: 1/2 A 1/2 B, (2) SS 23H $5,744.00 $5,744.00
3-light LED Micro-Edge, 2) 5M-400 Super-LED, (2) Side TIR3 LED, (2
) 400 Max B-T-T LED, & (2) 400 LED BU Lights, in Stainless M
Housings, (1) TIR3 LED Wing light, and (2) 4" LED work lights
Installed. NOTE: Blue Lights positioned on RH Front & LH Rear, with
flash pattern set to WIG-WAG.

3 9902519 - Light WHELEN MICRO PIONEER spot light, Installed $843.00 $2,529.00
**NOTE: (2) Mounted on PLOW LIGHT BRACKETS, For FOG LIGHT USE use,
Wired to HIGHBEAM (1) MOUNTED LOW FOR FRONT OF WING MOLD BOARD
ILLUMINATION ON WING LIGHTSWITCH

1 9905778 - Light Mirror Mounted ABL 3800 LED HEAD LAMP PLOW LIGHTS $1,567.00 $1,567.00
W/ICE MELTING TECHNOLOGY Installed

71 9900267 - Fender set Minimizer M400, for Tandem Axle, black Poly, $1,839.00 $1,839.00
Installed

1 1965280 - Minimizer FKMAC2B Floor Mat Set for MACK SGL & TDM $253.00 $253.00

1 9905144 - Tarp Shur-Co Arm-Matic electric tarp SGL & TDM w/air lock $6,150.00 $6,150.00

kit, front hold down roller kit, & STD motor Installed

2 9901143 - Snow-Board Pockets set of 4 1901318 Installed, Equally $346.00 $692.00
spaced and cut thru top rails of side.
Specify Side Here: BOTH SIDES

2 9900279 - Body Acc'y Side Boards (SGL or TDM) 2" OAK (rough sawn) $853.00 $1,706.00
2-pc, Installed.

1 9904691 - INSTALLATION of (Initial) Single camera system or $471.00 $471.00
relocation of OEM

*-——- Continued ---*

Price:

Total Discounts:
Accepted by Date Net Cost:

Ml £ Holl 1550k 335

’ Total:

TRKQT3MOD022324
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TRUCK EQUIPMENT Reference No.
TOWMASTER, 61381 US HWY 12, LITCHFIELD, MN 55355

PH: 3206937900 Fx: 320-693-792] TF: BO0-462-4517 QT 98109
TOWMASTERTRUCK,COM
** QUOTATION **
Ship To: Cust: 3249 Phone: Bill To: Phone:
MONTICELLO, CITY OF MONTICELLO, CITY OF
505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1 505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1
MONTICELLO MN 55362 USA MONTICELLO MN 55362

ATTN: MATT BARTHEL

Last Revised
9/05/25

Created
9/05/25

Appx Comp
0/00/00

Salesman
JOSH PAULSON

NET 30 DAYS

Serial No.

**NOTE: MOUNTED ON RH STROBE TUBE, FOR WING VIEWING USAGE, WIRED AS
DEFAULT
2 9904692 - Camera System option, 120 degree night vision CCD $182.00 $364.00

weather-proof HEATED camera, only GEN 5 6100

2 9904693 - Camera System option, Harness, 65' Waterproof GEN 5 6100 $195.00 $390.00

1 9904694 - INSTALLATION of Extra Camera, & Harness GEN 5 6100 $235.00 $235.00
**NOTE: MOUNTED ON LH REAR CORNER POST, FOR REVERSE VIEWING USAGE,
WIRED TO QUE UP BY REVERSE SIGNAL.

1 1941405 - Camera Guard, SS, Bolt-On $43.00 $43.00

1 9905501 - PreCise ARC Sensor Kit #1125402, Wired (No Display), for $766.00 $766.00
use w/existing RW Display or 6100 Display (Includes M8 cable)

1 9905502 - PreCise ARC Sensor Mount #1126929, only GEN 5 6100 $80.00 $80.00

1 9900296 - Pre-Wet Towmaster/Varitech LDS-TG150-EGF Tailgate mt $6,334.00 $6,334.00
System. 150 gal tank, SS mtg hardware, plumbing, & Electric Gravit
y Feed Valve system.

1 9902487 - Installation of TAILGATE pre-wet system (New Towmaster) $1,098.00 $1,098.00
TO BE OLD STYLE OVER THE TAILGATE MOUNTING

1 9900297 - Pre-Wet Towmaster/Varitech LDS-TMR-190-EGF Body Side Mt Sys $4,730.00 $4,730.00
for Elliptical body. (2) 95 gal tanks, mtg hardware, plumbi
ng, Electric Gravity Feed valve

1 9902483 - Installation of TMR pre-wet system (New Towmaster Body) $1,411.00 $1,411.00
TO HAVE MANUAL VALVE TO SWITCH BEWTWEEN SPRAY BAR AND SPINNERS. TO

*——-- Continued ---%*

Price:

Total Discounts:

Accepted by Date Net Cost:
/ﬁw f /%%u ki 56!),' A5 Freight
Total:

TRKQT3MOD022324



2M (14)

TRUCK EQUIPMENT
TOWMASTER, 61381 US HWY 12, LITCHFIELD, MN 55355

Reference No.

PH: 320-693-7900 FX: 320-693-7921 TF: BOO-462-4517 Qr 98109
TOWMASTERTRUCK.COM
** QUOTATION **
Ship To: Cust: 3249  Phone: Bill To: Phone:
MONTICELLO, CITY OF MONTICELLO, CITY OF
505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1 505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1
MONTICELLO MN 55362 USA MONTICELLO MN 55362

ATTN: MATT BARTHEL

Salesman
JOSH PAULSON

NET 3

Terms

0 DAYS

Created
9/05/25

Last Revised
9/05/25

Appx Comp
0/00/00

Serial No.

HAVE MAIN HOSE RUN THROUGH FRAMELONG SILLS (SEE JOSH FOR QUESTIONS)
Qty Part No. Description Price Ea. Net Amt.

1 9905480 - Pre-Wet SS Prewet Distrbution Pipe Thru Sander $660.00 $660.00
9900317 - Hoist Towmaster/MAILHOT G4 130-5-3 DOUBLE ACTING $5,105.00 $5,105.00
9901711 - Installation of Telescopic DOUBLE acting hoist $2,161.00 $2,161.00
9900311 - Hoist TMTE 48" Stabilizer $2,615.00 $2,615.00
9902503 - Installation of TMTE Stabilizer & Safety Props $743.00 $743.00

1 9902924 - Scraper FALLS IB-10A 1" x 17" MB, w/single lift cylinder $10,186.00 $10,186.00
W/12" bolt-on extension (1l1' total), LESS CUTTING EDGES

1 9901705 - Installation of underbody fixed angle scraper w/single lift $3,887.00 $3,887.00
cylinder

1 9904232 - Scraper FORCE Electric pressure transmitter to read on LCD $429.00 $429.00
screen, installed

1 9900351 - Scraper FORCE reverse/Auto-Lift system, ADD-A-FOLD valve, $538.00 $538.00
installed

1 9902948 - Wing Falls RHSDL10A-HYDPB Primed LESS CUTTING EDGES $15,058.00 $15,058.00

1 9900389 - Installation Falls SDL Series Wing - w/Dripless Bulkhead $7,060.00 $7,060.00
Couplers
TO HAVE FULL CROSS BRACE FOR REAR WING BRACKET

1 9901431 - Wing Falls RL (REAR LIFT) up charge SDL WING $649.00 $649.00

1 9904688 - Wing Falls POST-LESS Toe Lift in lieu of Std Front
post/slide system
*-—- Continued ---%*

Accepted by Date
tl § %U (9 Sepl 203

TRKQT3MOD022324

Pri

ce:

Total Discounts:
Net Cost:

Freight
Total:
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TRUCK EQUIPMENT Reference No.

TOWMASTER, 61381 US HWY 12, LITCHFIELD, MN 55355

PH: 320-693-7900 FX: 320-693-7921 TF: B00-462-4517 QT 98109
TOWMASTERTRUCK.COM
#* QUOTATION **
Ship To: Cust: 3249 Phone: Bill To: Phone:
MONTICELLO, CITY OF MONTICELLO, CITY OF
505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1 505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1
MONTICELLO MN 55362 USA MONTICELLO MN 55362

ATTN: MATT BARTHEL

Last Revised
9/05/25

Created
9/05/25

Terms Appx Comp

0/00/00

Salesman

JOSH PAULSON NET 30 DAYS

Serial No.
**NOTE: NO EXTRA CHARGE

1 9900477 - Wing Falls Hwy Orange - Paint Moldboard $465.00 $465.00
1 9900545 - Plow Hitch Falls Installation of (supplied) Multi-Coupler
FOR PLOW STEER
1 9900555 - Plow Hitch Falls 44XB2/STD/STD/SA/SPR-RET/HITCH $4,478.00 $4,478.00
1 9900589 - Installation Falls Plow Hitch - 40 Series 3Line/STDBLKHD $2,626.00 $2,626.00
1 9900625 - Plow Push Unit Falls 24/44 Series Std $1,312.00 $1,312.00
1 9900637 - Plow Falls High Visibility Marker Set $161.00 $161.00
1 9900639 - Plow Falls 1/2" x 12" Standard Rubber Belt Snow Deflector $509.00 $509.00
Kit - Installed
1 9900641 - Plow Falls Parking Stand - Screw Adj Style $391.00 $391.00
1 9903074 - Plow Falls Poly PTE-1248/TRP-EDG/NOSHU/POLY-BLK Plow LESS $13,509.00 $13,509.00
CUTTING EDGES
1 9900757 - Hitch TMTE Heavy Duty plate assembly, $623.00 $623.00
— 1 9901716 - Hitch Installation of Pup Hitch (weld in style) or Mn Dot $1,253.00 $1,253.00
Predrilled
**NOTE: HITCH PLATE FACE TO BE LOCATED:
IN REFERENCE TO REAR TIRE FACE.
***x* TO HAVE 2 D-RINGS ON PULL PLATE FOR HOOKING UP CHAINS. FALLS TO
) HAVE FULL CROSS BRACE FOR REAR WING POST
1 9900996 - Sander Falls 1ASD-6CDSS-6P-1D-2S-LM Salt Special 6", SS $8,533.00 $8,533.00
Unit, LH & RH Discharge, Dual Poly Spinner Ass'y, w/uni-
*--- Continued ---%*

Price:

Total Discounts:

Date Net Cost:

Accepted by

et £ Tl A

Freight
Total:

(4 Sepk 2056

TRKQT3MOD022324
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TRUCK EQUIPMENT Reference No.
TOWMASTER, 61381 US HWY 12, LITCHFIELD, MN 55355

PH: 320-693-7900 FX: 320-693-792] TF: B00-462-4517 QT 98109
TOWMASTERTRUCK.COM
** QUOTATION **
Ship To: Cust: 3249 Phone: Bill To: Phone:
MONTICELLO, CITY OF MONTICELLO, CITY OF
505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1 505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1
MONTICELLO MN 55362 USA MONTICELLO MN 55362

ATTN: MATT BARTHEL

Last Revised
9/05/25

Created
9/05/25

Appx Comp
0/00/00

Salesman

JOSH PAULSON

NET 30 DAYS

Serial No.
directional reversible auger (includes 1 extra salt shield), complete

1 9901724 - Sander Install dual spinner w/uni-directional reversible $3,227.00 $3,227.00
auger & dual manifolds RH & LH rear w/dripless couplers

1 1917108 - Sander Towmaster Stainless Steel (optional) salt shield $57.00 $57.00

1 9900823 - Sander TMTE Exterior (removable) sander/tailgate spill $624.00 $624.00
plates, Stainless Steel

1 9900851 - Valve System, Force Add-A-Fold MCV-ISO Valve 9 Functions, $17,211.00 $17,211.00
INSTALLED
HOIST, PLOW LIFT, PLOW STEER, WING TOE, WING HEEL, WING PUSH-BAR,
SCRAPER, AUGERR/L, SPINNER R/L

1 9902497 - Control System Force ULTRA-4-6100 Commander control, $15,961.00 $15,961.00
Installed
1 9900882 - Reservoir TMTE 31 Gal Cabshield mt (stainless steel) $4,267.00 $4,267.00

w/intank filter for system, installed

1 9900891 - Pump Force TXV92 (5.6 ci) Pump, 280 HOT SHIFT PTO for $8,811.00 $8,811.00
Allison Trans, w/Elec shut down installed

1 9900893 - Valve Force Cable pull-off (for use w/telescopic hoist) $758.00 $758.00
installed

1 9900936 - Valve Force ADDER for VERTICAL valve enclosure in lieu of $623.00 $623.00
standard

1 9905504 - Valve Force integrated float control (assist) valve and $966.00 $966.00

switch system ("Blade-Saver") for PLOW

*--- Continued ---%*

Price:

Total Discounts:

Accepted by Date Net Cost:
et ¢ Mo L (qsiphane i
Total:

TRKQT3MOD022324
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TRUCK EQUIPMENT

Reference No.

TOWMASTER, 61381 US HWY 12, LITCHFIELD, MN 55355 oT 98109
PH: 320-693-7900 FX: 320-693-7921 TF: 800-462-4517
TOWMASTERTRUCK.COM
#% QUOTATION **

Ship To: Cust: 3249  Phone: Bill To: Phone:

MONTICELLO, CITY OF MONTICELLO, CITY OF

505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1 505 WALNUT STREET, SUITE 1

MONTICELLO MN 55362 USA MONTICELLO MN 55362
ATTN: MATT BARTHEL

Salesman Terms Created Last Revised  Appx Comp

JOSH PAUL

SON

NET 30 DAYS

9/05/25

9/05/25

0/00/00

Serial No.

1 9900871 - Switch TMTE BODY UP Installed (electric controls only) $288.00 $288.00

1 9900884 - Sensor Force Low oil indicator system, SLIM-LINE AND $334.00 $334.00
CABSHIELD MOUNTED w/light mounted in cab, installed

1 9900904 - Valve 2-port 1/2" Multi-Hose coupler system installed $1,265.00 $1,265.00

FOR PLOW STEER

1 WARRANTY - TOWMASTER EXCLUSIVE WARRANTY: 5 yr Steel/Stainless Steel

Body Structure; 5 yr Whelen LED Light Systems;
4 yr Swaploader Hoists; 1 year Swenson Spreaders, 2 yr Hyd, FALLS
Snow Equip, Tele/Scissor Hoists, and all other items.

Price: $212,342.00

Total Discounts:
$212,342.00

Accepted b}/ ’, 7 Date Net Cost:
ol LA (g a055
Total: $212,342.00

TRKQT3MOD022324
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4\, Monticello

VERBAL/WRITTEN QUOTE SUMMARY SHEET

Minimum 2 verbal or written quotes required for items/services costing at least $2,500 but less than
$9,999. Minimum 3 written quotes required for items/services costing at least $10,000 but less than
$24,999.

No Quotes are required for items purchased through state cooperative purchasing venture.

Use this form to summarize quotes received and to select vendor for award.

Name: M(“L’\M_/\ HC\C\(&Y\}_ Dept: SMA— D(A?\‘" Phone: W3 A7 331

L, Wl L

Signature of Person Obtaining Quotes:

Item/Service Requested: M\'D GW

@Budgeted CUnbudgeted
Note: If you are unable to obtain required number of quotes, provide an explanation below in notes/comments.
# Date Vendor Name Contact Person Phone Number Total $ Amount
Quoted
1 |21 00k 25T Lubecon &
: & ] maskl | 1350 701 €53 | A 3502
Aot e Jim C‘udkbwb 4 /(}J

Selected Vendor: Ld\)&CC‘#"‘D 5 Poors s

(If you are selecting other than low quote, you are required to provide written justification as to why low quote
was not selected in the notes/comments section):

Notes/comments:

Sl Conkad— Prfcrwa, ,

Approval Acknowledgement: Date:

Attach this form and written quotes obtained to invoice. Questions may be directed to the
Finance Department.

Quote Summary Sheet 03/21/2025
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RLubecore MN - Next Generation Automated Lubrication

City of Monticello - 2026 Plow truck Autolube

City of Monticello Reference: 20251031-085507787
909 Colf Course Rd, 1 Quote created: October 31, 2025
Monticello, MN 55362 Quote expires: January 29, 2026
United States Quote created by: James CzajkowskKi

Owner

jimc@lubecoremn.com
Mike Haaland +13207616532

mike.haaland@ci.monticello.mn.us
763-271-3277

Comments from James Czajkowski

Installation at our Avon Mn shop.
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Products & Services

Item & Description Quantity Unit Price Total

44 point Tandem axle Plow truck; Lubecore EPO 4kg 1 $10,350.00 $10,350.00
Pneumatic pump with automatic Low level shutoff, stay clear

Makrolon Reservoir with integrated pressure gauge and Timer.

Brass metering manifolds, Brass injectors, Brass terminal in-

serts, Nylon Line (with loom in wear areas). Installed and tested,

ready for work.

Power supply is 12v and consists of ignition power and ground. Pneumatic

pump supply from the secondary tank with supplied Air protection kit.

Quote based on State of Mn s863 contract data.

One-time subtotal $10,350.00

Total $10,350.00

Purchase terms



| l TRUCK &
ant ) EQUIPMENT®

1-888-NUSSGRP
WWW.Nnussgrp.com

Conditional Appraisal Value

*VALUE SUBJECT TO NT&E TRADE TERMS AGREEMENT*
CONSULT WITH YOUR SALES REPRESENTATIVE FOR DETAILS
ESTIMATED VALUE VALID FOR 30 DAYS FROM APPROVAL DATE

Appraisal Approval Date: 10/1 /2025 11:05 AM

Customer Name

City Of Monticello Public Works

Sales Representative

Brad Schmidt

Store Location

Nuss Truck & Equipment - Mankato

53976 208th Ln
Mankato, MN 56002
507-327-9679
507-327-9679

Contact Number(s)

Contact Email bschmidt@nussgrp.com |
Customer Unit Number 116
Unit Details 2012 Mack GU812
VIN/Serial 1M2AX11C7CM001427
Mileage 61,474
Estimated Value $48,000.00
Notes/Comments

7|

MACK. m— VOLVO TOOLS THAT MAKE YOUR

BUSINESS WORK.

FAMILY OWNED & OPERATED
SINC E 1959

BURNSVILLE » DULUTH  EAST BETHEL  EAU CLAIRE * MANKATO
MONTICELLO » ROCHESTER © ROSEVILLE © SIKESTON ¢ ST. cLouD
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